January 18, 2022

Materials Management

Purchasing Department

101 OId Venice Road, Osprey, FL 34229
Phone 941-486-2183 = Fax 941-486-2188
SarasotaCountySchools.net

SARASOTA

County Schools

MEMORANDUM

TO: Members of the School Board
Dr. Brennan Asplen III, Superintendent
Mitsi Corcoran, Assistant Superintendent Chief Financial Officer

FROM: Tracy Brizendine, Director of Materials Management
TITLE: APPROVAL TO AWARD BID #22-0028 FOR FOOD SERVICE LARGE
EQUIPMENT

Bids to provide food service large equipment were received from six vendors on December 2,
2021. The bids of 7GENS LLC, Johnson-Lancaster Sales, LLC, Pueblo Hotel Supply, Stafford-
Smith, Inc., and Strategic Equipment, LLC were the best low bids meeting the advertised
specifications. Reasons for not selecting the apparent low bid are included with the bid tabulation.
This bid is for a period of one year with an option to renew for two additional one-year periods.
The funds for these purchases are contained in the budget allocated to the Food and Nutrition
Services Department.

Requested by: “Failure to file a protest within Financial Impact:
the time prescribed in Section
Sara Dan 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, or Not to exceed:
failure to post the protest bond
ailure to pos € protest bon $ 1 60,000.00

or other security required by
law within the time allowed for
filing a bond shall constitute a
waiver of proceedings under
Chapter 120. Florida Statutes.”

Posting Date: 1/11/22

Recommended Motion: That the bids of 7GENS LLC, Johnson-Lancaster Sales, LLC, Pueblo
Hotel Supply, Stafford-Smith, Inc., and Strategic Equipment, LLC, for ‘Food Service Large
Equipment’ in an amount not to exceed $160,000.00 be approved as presented.

SarasotaCountySchools.net



THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Food Service Large Equipment - Bid #22-0028

Opened December 2, 2021 at 2:00 p.m. EST

Brands and models listed on the bid form have been pre-evaluated and
standardized by the SBSC. Firm fixed prices shall include all shipping
charges for F. O. B. Destination delivery to various locations. Bid pricing
includes off load, removal of packaging and set in place at various locations.
Bids of alternate items will not be accepted.

7GENS LLC

ltem #

Description

Douglas Equipment

Johnson-Lancaster
Sales, LLC

Pueblo Hotel Supply

Stafford-Smith, Inc.

Strategic
Equipment, LLC

ALTO SHAAM

Hot Food Well Unit, Alto Shaam Model No. 400-HWLF/D4

Drop in, Electric, (4) 12" x 20" full-size pan capacity, 4-3/8" deep well,
(2) adjustable thermostatic controller, stainless steel construction, 208-
240v/50/60/1-ph, Dimensions: 7.31(h) x 57.31(w) x 27.06(d).

Indicate warranty:

$2,595.00

1 year parts/labor

$2,635.75

$2,193.09

1 year parts/labor

$2,196.92

1 year parts/labor

BLODGETT

$3,306.00

1 year parts/labor

$2,515.00

1 year parts/labor

Convection Oven, Electric, Blodgett Model No. Mark V Single
Standard depth, capacity (5) 18" x 26" pans per compartment,
individual digital controls w/ manual timer, 2-speed fans, interior light,
simultaneous operated doors with glass, stainless steel front, sides &

$11,895.00

$11,194.62

$8,582.05

$9,159.97

$10,031.00

$11,480.00

ground. Gas manifold and flue connection included.

2 top, 25" stainless steel legs,480v, 60 HZ, 3 PH. NSF.
3 year parts, 2 year | 3 year parts, 2 year 3 vear parts. 2 vear 3 year parts, 2 year | 3 year parts, 2 year | 3 year parts, 2 year
Indicate warranty: labor, 2 year door labor, 2 year door year parts, 2y labor, 2 additional labor, 2 additional labor, 2 additional
labor
(parts) (parts) year door (parts) year door (parts) door (parts)
Convection Oven, Electric, Blodgett Model No. Mark V Single
Standard depth, capacity (5) 18" x 26" pans per compartment,
individual digital controls w/ manual timer, 2-speed fans, interior light, $11,045.00 $11,768.96 $8,016.43 $9,159.97 $9,333.00 $10,740.00
simultaneous operated doors with glass, stainless steel front, sides &
3 top, 25" stainless steel legs, 280v, 60Hz, 3 PH. NSF.
3 year parts, 2 year | 3 year parts, 2 year 3 vear parts. 2 vear 3 year parts, 2 year | 3 year parts, 2 year | 3 year parts, 2 year
Indicate warranty: labor, 2 year door labor, 2 year door Y ‘I)abor’ y labor, 2 additional labor, 2 additional labor, 2 additional
(parts) (parts) year door (parts) year door (parts) year door (parts)
Convection Oven, Gas, Blodgett Model No. DFG-100
Standard depth, capacity (5) 18" x 26" pans per compartment,
individual digital controls w/ manual timer, 2-speed fans, interior light,
simultaneous operated doors with glass, stainless steel front, sides & $11,715.00 $24,072.24 $16,106.75 $18,859.82 $18,580.00 $21,450.00
4 |top, 25" stainless steel legs,55,000 BTU each, 115v/60/1-ph, 3 wire

Indicate warranty:

3 year parts, 2 year
labor, 2 year door
(parts)

3 year parts, 2 year
labor, 2 year door
(parts)

3 year parts, 2 year
labor

3 year parts, 2 year
labor, 2 additional
year door (parts)

3 year parts, 2 year
labor, 2 additional
year door (parts)

3 year parts, 2 year
labor, 2 additional
door (parts)




Food Service Larg

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

e Equipment - Bid #22-0028

Opened December 2, 2021 at 2:00 p.m. EST

Brands and models listed on the bid form have been pre-evaluated and
standardized by the SBSC. Firm fixed prices shall include all shipping Johnson-Lancaster Strategic
charges for F. O. B. Destination delivery to various locations. Bid pricing 7GENS LLC Douglas Equipment Sales. LLC Pueblo Hotel Supply| Stafford-Smith, Inc. Equi gt LLC
includes off load, removal of packaging and set in place at various locations. ales, quipment,
Bids of alternate items will not be accepted.
Iltem #‘ Description
BLODGETT (cont.)
Oven, Blodgett Model No. HVH-100G DBL
Hydrovection, Gas, full size, double stacked, black glass doors,
halogen lamps, stainless steel racks, cavity vent, 7" touchscreen $36,175.00 $39,202.58 $26,263.14 $30,624.11 $32,117.00 $34,070.00
5 control, stainless steel exterior, stainless steel legs with casters and
stacking kit, 3/4 HP, 60,000 BTU, NSF.
Indicate warranty: 1 year parts/labor 1 year parts/labor 1 year parts/labor 1 year parts/labor 1 year parts/labor 1 year parts/labor
DELFIELD
Serving Counter, Delfield Model No. SC-50-NU
Shelleysteel solid top all purpose counter w/ enclosed base 36" high, .
6 Line-up interlock, Laminate finish, 705B Sq cutout for ASM-36 $1,830.00 No Bid $3,009.30 $1,766.01 $2,349.00 $2,785.00
unit.Dimensions: 36(h) x 50(w) x 30(d), 720 Ibs.
Indicate warranty: 1 year parts/labor 1 year parts/labor 1 year parts/labor 1 year parts/labor 1 year parts/labor
Drop-In Refrigerated Merchandiser, Delfield Model No. ASM-36
Air screen, drop in, 36-1/4" LED lighting, bottom shelf, (3) 1"
adjustable_ glass shelvgs, (2) louvers, rear sliding doors, security night $19,850.00 No Bid $21,455.15 $17,731.11 $27,348.00 $25,380.00
7 cover, stainless steel sides, self contained bottom mounted
refrigeration, 1/2 hp, 115v/60/1, Dimensions; 63.48(h) x 36.25(w) x
26(d), 1400 Ibs.
Indicate warranty: 1 year parts/labor, 1 1 year parts/labor 1year parts/labor, 11 1 year parts/labor, 5 1 year parts/labor
year compressor year compressor year compressor
HATCO
Booster Heater, Electric, Hatco Model No. C-54-480-3-QS
6-gallon storage capacity, 54-KW, stainless steel front, Castone tank, $3,505.00 $3,408.02 $3,636.23 $3,307.16 $3,763.00 $3,460.00
8 6" legs, Dimensions: 18(h) x 18(w) x 24(d), NSF listed.
. . 1 year parts/labor, 10 | 1 year parts/labor, 10 1year parts/labor, 1 year parts/labor, 10 | 1 year parts/labor, 10
Indicate warranty: 1 year parts/labor 10 year Castone
year Castone tank year Castone tank tank year Castone tank year Castone tank




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Food Service Large Equipment - Bid #22-0028 Opened December 2, 2021 at 2:00 p.m. EST

Brands and models listed on the bid form have been pre-evaluated and
standardized by the SBSC. Firm fixed prices shall include all shipping

Johnson-Lancaster

Strategic

charges for F. O. B. Destination delivery to various locations. Bid pricing 7GENS LLC Douglas Equipment Pueblo Hotel Supply| Stafford-Smith, Inc. X
includes off load, removal of packaging and set in place at various locations. Sales, LLC Equipment, LLC
Bids of alternate items will not be accepted.
Item #‘ Description
HATCO (cont.)
Booster Heater, Electric, Hatco Model No. C-57-208-3-QS
6-gallon storage capacity, 57-KW, stainless steel front, Castone tank, $3,620.00 $3,518.02 $3,739.71 $3,417.16 $3,892.00 $3,565.00
9 6" legs, Dimensions: 18(h) x 18(w) x 24(d), NSF listed.
. . 1 year parts/labor, 10 | 1 year parts/labor, 10 1year parts/labor, 1 year parts/labor, 10 | 1 year parts/labor, 10
Indicate warranty: 1 year parts/labor 10 year Castone
year Castone tank year Castone tank tank year Castone tank year Castone tank
Booster Heater, Electric, Hatco Model No. S-24-480-3
16-gallon storage capacity, 24-KW, stainless steel front, Castone $3,385.00 $3,292.52 $3,527.56 $3,241.03 $3,628.00 $3,440.00
10 tank, 6" legs, Dimensions: 31(h) x 23.53(w) x 22.75(d), NSF listed.
. . 1 year parts/labor, 10 | 1 year parts/labor, 10 1year parts/labor, 1 year parts/labor, 10 | 1 year parts/labor, 10
Indicate warranty: 1 year parts/labor 10 year Castone
year Castone tank year Castone tank tank year Castone tank year Castone tank
Booster Heater, Electric, Hatco Model No. S-36-480-3
16-gallon storage capacity, 36-KW, stainless steel front, Castone $3,675.00 $3,567.52 $3,786.28 $3,516.03 $3,950.00 $3,710.00
1 tank, 6" legs, Dimensions: 31(h) x 23.53(w) x 22.75(d), NSF listed.
. . 1 year parts/labor, 10 | 1 year parts/labor, 10 1year parts/labor, 1 year parts/labor, 10 | 1 year parts/labor, 10
Indicate warranty: 1 year parts/labor 10 year Castone
year Castone tank year Castone tank tank year Castone tank year Castone tank
HUBBELL -
Booster Heater, Electric, Hubbell Model No. J654
6-gallon storage capacity, 54-KW, 208/60/3, stainless steel tank,
stainless steel exterior, plastic adjustable legs, electronic display $3,410.00 $7,610.72 $3,327.50 No Bid $2,860.00 $3,220.00
12 controller with low water cut-off & leak detection, Dimensions: 18(h) x
18(w) x 29.13(d), NSF listed.
Indicate warranty: 10 year tank 10 year tank 10 year tank 10 year tank 10 year tank
Booster Heater, Electric, Hubbell Model No. J654
6-gallon storage capacity, 54-KW, 480/60/3, stainless steel tank,
stainless steel exterior, plastic adjustable legs, electronic display $3,400.00 $7,485.72 $3,327.50 No Bid $2,860.00 $3,220.00
13 controller with low water cut-off & leak detection, Dimensions: 18(h) x
18(w) x 29.13(d), NSF listed.
Indicate warranty: 10 year tank 10 year tank 10 year tank 10 year tank 10 year tank




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Food Service Large Equipment - Bid #22-0028

Opened December 2, 2021 at 2:00 p.m. EST

Brands and models listed on the bid form have been pre-evaluated and
standardized by the SBSC. Firm fixed prices shall include all shipping

Johnson-Lancaster

Strategic

evaporator, 5 year

evaporator, 5 year

evaporator, 5 year

16

charges for F. O. B. Destination delivery to various locations. Bid pricing 7GENS LLC Douglas Equipment Pueblo Hotel Supply| Stafford-Smith, Inc. -
includes off load, removal of packaging and set in place at various locations. Sales, LLC Equipment, LLC
Bids of alternate items will not be accepted.
ltem # Description
HOSHIZAKI
Ice Maker, Cube Style, Hoshizaki Model No. KML-325MAJ
30"W, air cooled, self contained condenser, production capacity up to
380 Ib/24 hours, stainless steel finish, dimensions: 22(h) x 30(w) x $3,010.00 $3,127.45 $2,600.50 $2,707.38 $2,599.00 $3,115.00
27.38(d), NSF listed.
14 3 year parts{labor 3 year parts{labor 3 year parts/labor 3 year parts/labor 5
entire machine, 5 entire machine, 5 entire machine, 5 year 3 year parts/labor 5
3 year parts/labor 5 year parts/labor
. . year parts/labor year parts/labor parts/labor year parts/labor
Indicate warranty: year compressor evaporator,

evaporator & air-

Indicate warranty:

entire machine, 5
year parts/labor
evaporator, 5 year

entire machine, 5
year parts/labor
evaporator, 5 year

3 year parts/labor, 5
year compressor

entire machine, 5 year
parts/labor
evaporator, 5 year

3 year parts/labor, 5
year parts/labor
evaporator,

parts compressor & | parts compressor & (parts) parts compressor & comlp(rjesso;& air- cooled condenser
air cooled condenser | air cooled condenser air cooled condenser | €00!ed condenser
Ice Bin, B-500SF
30"W,top-hinged front-opening door, 500-Ib ice storage capacity,
15 stainless steel finish, 6" painted legs, dimensions: 40(h) x 30(w) x $1.265.00 $1,393.51 $1,179.56 $1.129.54 $1,061.00 $1,295.00
28(d)
Indicate warranty: 3 year parts/labor 3 year parts/labor 3 year parts/labor 3 year pat;‘itrs]/labor ont 3 year;);r)‘a:izllabor 3 year parts/labor
Ice Maker, Cube Style, Hoshizaki Model No. KM520MAJ
22"W, air cooled, self contained condenser, production capacity up to
527 1b/24 hours, stainless steel finish, dimensions: 30.31(h) x 22(w) x $3,510.00 $3,650.71 $3,029.60 $3,174.46 $3,063.00 $3,595.00
27.38(d), NSF listed.
3 year parts/labor 3 year parts/labor 3 year parts/labor

3 year parts/labor, 5
year parts/labor
evaporator & air-

parts compressor and |parts compressor and (parts) parts compressor and comlpressor & air- cooled condenser
air cooled condenser | air cooled condenser air cooled condenser | €©° ed condenser
Ice Bin, B-300SF
22"W top-hinged front-opening door, 300-Ib ice storage capacity,
17 stainless steel finish, 6" painted legs, dimensions: 40(h) x 22(w) x $1,150.00 $1,270.39 $1.078.82 $1,012.97 $951.00 $1,170.00
28(d)
Indicate warranty: 3 year parts/labor 3 year parts/labor 3 year parts/labor 3 year pagitillabor ont 3 yearo?‘atl;tizllabor 3 year parts/labor
Top Kit, HS-2033
18 8" for 22" wide ice machines. $145.00 $296.50 $105.09 $116.58 $114.00 $125.00
Indicate warranty: 3 year parts/labor N/A 90 day 90 day parts 3 year parts/labor




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Food Service Large Equipment - Bid #22-0028 Opened December 2, 2021 at 2:00 p.m. EST

Brands and models listed on the bid form have been pre-evaluated and
standardized by the SBSC. Firm fixed prices shall include all shipping Johnson-Lancaster Strateaic
charges for F. O. B. Destination delivery to various locations. Bid pricing 7GENS LLC Douglas Equipment Sales. LLC Pueblo Hotel Supply| Stafford-Smith, Inc. Equi g: LLC
includes off load, removal of packaging and set in place at various locations. ales, quipment,
Bids of alternate items will not be accepted.
Item # Description
ICE-O-MATIC
Ice Maker, Cube Style, Ice-O-Matic Model No. CIMO330A
30"W, air cooled, self contained condenser, production capacity up to
313 1b/24 hours, dimensions: 21.25(h) x 30.25(w) x 24.25(d), NSF $3,610.00 $2649.33 $2,565.86 $2,424.29 $2,900.00 $3,280.00
listed.
1
9 3 year parts/labor, 5 | 3 year parts/labor, 5 3 year parts/labor, 5 3 year parts/labor, 5 3 year parts/labor, 5
3 year parts/labor, 5 year parts/labor
. . year evaporator, 5 year evaporator, 5 year evaporator, 5 year parts/labor
Indicate warranty: year compressor evaporator, .
year parts year parts (parts) year parts COMDressor & air- evaporator & air-
compressor compressor P compressor coolz d condenser cooled condenser
Ice Maker, Cube Style, Ice-O-Matic Model No. CIM0430A
30"W, air cooled, self contained condenser, production capacity up to
435 Ib/24 hours, dimensions: 21.25(h) x 30.25(w) x 24.25(d), NSF $3,965.00 $2,899.68 $2,807.51 $2,669.27 $3,196.00 $3,590.00
listed.
2
0 3 year parts/labor, 5 | 3 year parts/labor, 5 3 year parts/labor, 5 3 year parts/labor 5 3 year parts/labor, 5
3 year parts/labor 5 year parts/labor
. . year evaporator, 5 year evaporator, 5 year evaporator, 5 year parts/labor
Indicate warranty: year compressor evaporator, .
year parts on year parts (parts) year parts COMDressor & air- evaporator & air-
compressor compressor P compressor coolz d condenser cooled condenser
Ice Bin, B40PS
Top-hinged front-opening door, 344-Ib ice storage capacity, 30(w), $1,335.00 $1,243.54 $1,046.66 $895.48 $1,038.00 $1,190.00
21 |stainless steel, 6" legs, NSF listed.
Indicate warranty: 2 year parts/labor 2 year parts/labor 2 year parts/labor 2 year parts/labor 2 year pagitillabor oni o year parts/labor
Ice Maker, Cube Style, Ice-O-Matic Model No. CIMO636A
30"W, air cooled, self contained condenser, production capacity up to
600 Ib/24 hours, dimensions: 21.25(h) x 30.25(w) x 24.25(d), NSF $4,855.00 $3,545.08 $3,433.35 $3,280.75 $3,964.00 $4,360.00
listed.
22
3 year parts/labor, 5 | 3 year parts/labor, 5 3 year parts/labor, 5 3 year partsflabor, 5 3 year parts/labor, 5
3 year parts/labor, 5 year parts/labor
. . year evaporator, 5 year evaporator, 5 year evaporator, 5 year parts/labor
Indicate warranty: year compressor evaporator, .
year parts on year parts on (parts) year parts COmDressor & air- evaporator & air-
compressor compressor p compressor coolz d condenser cooled condenser
Ice Maker, Cube Style, Ice-O-Matic Model No. CIMO836A
30.25"W, air cooled, self contained condenser, production capacity up $6,005.00 $4.482.17 $4.334.96 $4,218.62 $5.069.00 $5.535.00
to 896 Ib/24 hours, dimensions: 26.9(h) x 30.25(w) x 24.25(d), NSF . T T S U D
listed.
2 3 year parts/labor, 5 | 3 year parts/labor, 5 3 year parts/labor, 5 3 year partsflabor, 5 3 year parts/labor, 5
3 year parts/labor, 5 year parts/labor
. . year evaporator, 5 year evaporator, 5 year evaporator, 5 year parts/labor
Indicate warranty: year compressor evaporator,
year parts on year parts on (parts) year parts Compressor & evaporator &
compressor compressor P compressor cor? denser condenser




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Food Service Large Equipment - Bid #22-0028

Opened December 2, 2021 at 2:00 p.m. EST

Brands and models listed on the bid form have been pre-evaluated and
standardized by the SBSC. Firm fixed prices shall include all shipping Johnson-Lancaster Strateaic
charges for F. O. B. Destination delivery to various locations. Bid pricing 7GENS LLC Douglas Equipment Sales. LLC Pueblo Hotel Supply| Stafford-Smith, Inc. Equi g: LLC
includes off load, removal of packaging and set in place at various locations. ales, quipment,
Bids of alternate items will not be accepted.
Item #‘ Description
ICE-O-MATIC (cont.)
Ice Bin, B55PS
Top-hinged front-opening door, 510-Ib ice storage capacity, 30(w), $1,520.00 $1,378.57 $1,177.01 $1,036.62 $1,198.00 $1,365.00
24 |stainless steel, 6" legs, NSF listed.
Indicate warranty: 2 year parts/labor 2 year parts/labor 2 year parts/labor 2 year parts/labor 2 year pat;-itrs]/labor ot o year parts/labor
Ice Maker, Cube Style, Ice-O-matic Model No. ICEU150FA
Undercounter, air-cooled, self contained condenser, 70 Ib. built in bin,
apprx. 185 1b/24 hours, dimensions: 39(h) x 24.5(w) x 26.3(d), NSF $2,925.00 $2,197.35 $2,129.60 $1,999.81 $2,365.00 $2,635.00
listed.
2 3 year parts/labor, 5 | 3 year parts/labor, 5 3 year parts/labor, 5 3 year partsflabor, 5 3 year parts/labor, 5
year p ’ year p ’ 3 year parts/labor, 5 y ’ year parts/labor year p ’
. . year evaporator, 5 year evaporator, 5 year evaporator, 5 year evaporator, 5
Indicate warranty: year compressor evaporator,
year parts on year parts on year parts on . year parts on
(parts) compressor & air-
compressor compressor compressor cooled condenser compressor
MVP GROUP
Merchandiser, MVP Group Model No. KGL-RM-40-S.
Multiplexible, digital controller, (2) locking rear loading doors,
manually operated front shutter, (2) adjustable shelves, silver front $8,765.00 $25,021.05 $10,393.20 $23,469.04 $7,775.00 $7,625.00
2 panel & grey bottom front panel, adjustable feet, 40 7/8"W x 36"D x
65"H.
1 year parts/labor, 4 | 1 year parts/labor, 4 | 1 year parts/labor, 1 year parts/labor, 4
Indicate warranty: additional years on | additional years on additional 4 year additional years on 1 year parts/labor, 4 | 1 year parts/labor, 4
years compressor year compressor
compressor compressor compressor (parts) compressor
SPECLINE
Refrigerated Frost Top Table
30"wide 14 guage stainless steel top, open storage base, 5" locking
27 . ) )
swivel casters, Cam operated line-up locks, standard grade laminate
to cover all sides.
1 year parts/labor, 1 year parts/labor
Indicate warranty: 1 year parts/labor 1 year parts/labor, 5 additional 4 year machine, 5 year 1 year parts/labor
year compressor
compressor (parts) compressor
a. |36-CFT, unit length 36", frost top length 25" $6,195.00 $6,633.20 $7,418.87 No Bid $5,575.00 $6,010.00
b. |50-CFT, unit length 50", frost top length 38" $6,930.00 $7,408.40 $8,186.32 No Bid $6,247.00 $6,720.00
c. | 60-CFT, unit length 60", frost top length 51" $7,500.00 $8,002.40 $8,774.38 No Bid $6,762.00 $7,275.00
d. | 66-CFT, unit length 66", frost top length 51" $7,915.00 $8,451.20 $9,268.69 No Bid $7,151.00 $7,695.00
e. |74-CFT, unit length 74", frost top length 64" $8,720.00 $9,276.80 $10,086.03 No Bid $7,867.00 $8,455.00
f.  |84-CFT, unit length 84", frost top length 76" $8,805.00 $19,389.20 $10,598.65 No Bid $8,315.00 $8,945.00
g. |96-CFT, unit length 96", frost top length 88" $13,645.00 $14,541.20 $15,347.79 No Bid $12,429.00 $13,160.00
h. |144-CFT, unit length 144", frost top length 88" $17,725.00 $18,885.20 $19,698.35 No Bid $16,194.00 $16,965.00




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Food Service Large Equipment - Bid #22-0028 Opened December 2, 2021 at 2:00 p.m. EST

Brands and models listed on the bid form have been pre-evaluated and

standardized by the SBSC. Firm fixed prices shall include all shipping

Johnson-Lancaster Strategic

N/A

charges for F. O. B. Destination delivery to various locations. Bid pricing 7GENS LLC Douglas Equipment Pueblo Hotel Supply| Stafford-Smith, Inc. -
includes off load, removal of packaging and set in place at various locations. Sales, LLC Equipment, LLC
Bids of alternate items will not be accepted.
Item # Description
TRAULSEN
Milk Cooler, Traulsen Model No. RMC34D4
Double access, sliding lift up & down lockable doors, holds (8) 13" x
13" crates, stainless steel interior and exterior, reinforced floor, heavy $6,255.00 $6,929.75 $4,720.80 $13,943.13 $5,121.00 $6,275.00
duty dunnage racks, 4" casters, dimensions: 46(h) x 34(w) x 34.25(d),
28 |NSF listed.
. . 3 year service/labor, | 3 year service/labor, 3 year parts/labor, 5 3 year service/labor, 5| 3 year service/labor, | 3 year service/labor,
Indicate warranty: year compressor
5 year compressor | 5 year compressor (parts) years compressor | 5 years compressor | 5 years compressor
Milk Cooler, Traulsen Model No. RMC49D4
Double access, sliding lift up & down lockable doors, holds (12) 13" x
13" crates, stainless steel interior and exterior, reinforced floor, heavy $6,955.00 $6,929.75 $5,242.06 $15,644.59 $5,725.00 $6,995.00
duty dunnage racks, 4" casters, dimensions: 46(h) x 34(w) x 34.25(d),
29 |NSF listed.
. . 3 year service/labor, | 3 year service/labor, 3 year parts/labor, 5 3 year service/labor, 5| 3 year service/labor, | 3 year service/labor,
Indicate warranty: year compressor
5 year compressor | 5 year compressor (parts) years compressor | 5 years compressor | 5 years compressor
VICTORY REFRIGERATION
Pass-Thru Refrigerator, Victory Refrigeration Model No. RS-1D-S1-
EW-PT
26.2 cu. ft. capacity, one section, (2) wide full height solid hinged
doors, (3) silver freeze shelves, stainless exterior & interior, electronic $9,375.00 $8,321.20 $9.235.36 $9,526.40 $7,493.00 $9,335.00
30 temperature control indicator, LED lighting, 6" adjustable stainless
steel legs, 84(h) x 31 1/4(w) x 38 5/8(d).
_ . 3 year parts/labor, 3 year parts/labor, | 3 year parts/labor, 5 3 year parts/labor, 4 3 year parts/labor, 4 3 year service/labor,
Indicate warranty: additional 4 year additional 4 year year compressor year parts
year parts compressor| 4 years compressor
compressor (parts) | compressor (parts) (parts) compressor
NUMBER OF DAYS FOR DELIVERY AFTER ORDER 1-25 weeks Lead Times Vary Varies 60-90 days 28 calendar days 21-40 days




Food Service Large Equipment - Bid #22-0028

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Opened December 2, 2021 at 2:00 p.m. EST

Brands and models listed on the bid form have been pre-evaluated and
standardized by the SBSC. Firm fixed prices shall include all shipping Johnson-Lancaster Strategic
charges for F. O. B. Destination delivery to various locations. Bid pricing 7GENS LLC Douglas Equipment Sales. LLC Pueblo Hotel Supply| Stafford-Smith, Inc. Equi gt LLC
includes off load, removal of packaging and set in place at various locations. ales, quipment,
Bids of alternate items will not be accepted.
Item # Description
Drop ship only, no
. inside delivery or set
Notes: . ) .
in place included in
pricing
Contact: Alan S. Krakowiak | Samantha Radford |Donna O. Lancaster Aryssa New David M. Stafford | Mark Kohlschmidt
Address: 12587 Route 438 301 North Street 13031 US Highway 170 Greenhorn Drive 3414 South Burdick 5843 Barry Road
19 North Street
. . Clearwater, FL Kalamazoo, MI
Irving, NY 14081 | Bluefield, WV 24701 33764 Pueblo, CO 81004 49001 Tampa, FL 33634

Telephone: 716-829-1781 304-327-0149 727-796-5622 719-542-8853 269-343-1240 972-896-9893

Fax: 304-325-3848 727-725-4309 719-542-8857 269-343-2509 813-983-2165

Fed. ID: 35-2504634 55-0585890 04-3726270 84-0702763 38-1059585 62-1808341

Email: akrakowiak sradford@douglaseq| donnal@johnson- aryssa dms@stafford amy.leasure

’ @7genslic.com uipment.us lancaster.com @gogradys.com smith.com @trimarkusa.com
Recorded by: Samantha Clark Witnessed by: Connie Troyer



mailto:sradford@douglasequipment.us
mailto:akrakowiak@7gensllc.com
mailto:akrakowiak@7gensllc.com
mailto:sradford@douglasequipment.us
mailto:sradford@douglasequipment.us
mailto:donnal@johnson-lancaster.com
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mailto:aryssa@gogradys.com
mailto:aryssa@gogradys.com
mailto:dms@staffordsmith.com
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mailto:amy.leasure@trimarkusa.com
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THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA
Justification for Award to Other than Low Bidder

Food Service Large Equipment - Bid #22-0028 Opened December 2, 2021 at 2:00 pm.
ltem # Vendor Description |
Douglas Equipment was non-respnsive to the bid by modifying the bid form pricing
ALL Douglas Equipment requirements. Delivery and set in place were not included in the pricing as
required by the bid.
16,18 |Johnson-Lancaster sales, LLC Awarded to Stafford-Smith, Inc. as overall low for ltem #16, #17 and #18 together

as a group.
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	FSLargeEquip22-0028TabBOLD
	Bid Tab
	Justification


