April 18, 2023

Materials Management

Purchasing Department

101 OId Venice Road, Osprey, FL 34229
Phone 941-486-2183 = Fax 941-486-2188
SarasotaCountySchools.net

SARASOTA

County Schools

MEMORANDUM

TO: Members of the School Board
Dr. Allison Foster, Superintendent
Bonnie Penner, Assistant Superintendent Chief Financial Officer

FROM: Tracy Brizendine, Director of Materials Management
TITLE: APPROVAL TO AWARD BID #23-0124 FOR AUTOMOTIVE/LIGHT
TRUCK REPAIR PARTS

Bids to provide ‘Automotive/Light Truck Repair Parts’ were received from eight vendors on
March 21, 2023. The bids of Advance Stores Company, Incorporated dba Advance Auto Parts,
1-800 Radiator + A/C of Sarasota, Fleet Acquisitions LLC dba Fleet Products, IEH Auto Parts
LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts, Neopart Transit LLC, O’Reilly Automotive Stores, Inc dba
O’Reilly Auto Parts, and Vehicle Maintenance Program were the best low bids meeting the
advertised specifications. The bid of AutoZone Parts, Inc., was non-responsive due to
changing the terms and conditions of the bid. This bid is for a period of one year with an option
to renew for two additional one-year periods. The funds for these purchases are contained in
the budgets allocated to the Transportation Department.

Requested by: “Failure to file a protest within Financial Impact:
- the time prescribed in Section
Charlotte Price 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, or Not to exceed:
failure to post the protest bond
ailure to pos € protest bon $300,000.00

or other security required by
law within the time allowed for
filing a bond shall constitute a
waiver of proceedings under
Chapter 120. Florida Statutes.”

Posting Date: 4/11/23

Recommended Motion: That the bids of Advance Stores Company, Incorporated dba Advance
Auto Parts, 1-800 Radiator + A/C of Sarasota, Fleet Acquisitions LLC dba Fleet Products, IEH
Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts, Neopart Transit LLC, O’Reilly Automotive Stores, Inc
dba O’Reilly Auto Parts, and Vehicle Maintenance Program for ‘Automotive/Light Truck Repair
Parts’ in an amount not to exceed $300,000.00 be approved as presented.

SarasotaCountySchools.net



THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Tabulation of Automotive/Light Truck Repair Parts - Bid #23-0124 Opened March 21, 2023 at 1:00 p.m. EST
Percentage Discount off Current List Price per Advance Stores Company,
Manufacturer or Approved Alternate. Incorporated dba Advance Auto AutoZone Parts, Inc. 1-800 Radiator + A/C of Sarasota
THIS BID IS FOR NEW PARTS ONLY. Parts
Percent P t Percent
# Items Manufacturer: . Manufacturer: 'ercen Manufacturer: .

Discount: Discount: Discount:
#1-1 |ACDELCO AC Delco 8% As Spec 50% No Bid No Bid
#1-2 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-1: Carquest 8% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-3 ANCO WIPER BLADES No Bid No Bid As Spec 50% No Bid No Bid
#1-4 In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-3: Carquest 33% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-5 AUTOLITE Autolite 10% As Spec 50% No Bid No Bid
#1-6 In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-5: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-7 BALDWIN FILTERS Baldwin 65% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-8 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-7: Carquest 65% STP 50% No Bid No Bid
#1-9 BENDIX BRAKE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-10 In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-9: No Bid No Bid Bosch /GRI 50% No Bid No Bid
#1-11 BOSCH Bosch 20% As Spec 50% No Bid No Bid




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Tabulation of Automotive/Light Truck Repair Parts - Bid #23-0124 Opened March 21, 2023 at 1:00 p.m. EST

Percentage Discount off Current List Price per Fleet Acquisitions LLC dba Fleet |IEH Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus

Manufacturer or Approved Alternate. d NEOPART TRANSIT LLC
THIS BID IS FOR NEW PARTS ONLY. Products Auto Parts

P t P t P t
# | Items Manufacturer: .ercen Manufacturer: .ercen Manufacturer: .ercen
Discount: Discount: Discount:
AS SPEC
#1-1 ACDELCO As Spec 45% DEALER LESS 0% No Bid No Bid
0%
#1-2 In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-1: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-3 /ANCO WIPER BLADES As Spec 65% AS SPEC 70% No Bid No Bid
#1-4 In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-3: No Bid No Bid TRICO 60% No Bid No Bid
#1-5 AUTOLITE As Spec 70% AS SPEC 60% No Bid No Bid
#1-6 In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-5: No Bid No Bid CHAMPION 60% No Bid No Bid
#1-7 BALDWIN FILTERS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
WIX, AUTO
EXTRA OIL &
#1-8 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-7: Wix Heavy Duty 83.70% AIR, AUTO 78.05% No Bid No Bid
EXTRA FUEL &
TRANS

#1-9 BENDIX BRAKE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid As Spec 25%
#1-10 | In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-9: Raybestos 66% WAGNER 70% No Bid No Bid
#1-11 BOSCH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid As Spec 10%




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Tabulation of Automotive/Light Truck Repair Parts - Bid #23-0124

Opened March 21, 2023 at 1:00 p.m. EST

Percentage Discount off Current List Price per O'Reilly Automotive Stores, Inc. . .

Manufacturer or Approved Alternate. dba O'Reilly A p Vehicle Maintenance Program

THIS BID IS FOR NEW PARTS ONLY. a O'Reilly Auto Parts

Percent Percent
# ltems Manufacturer: ) Manufacturer: )
Discount: Discount:
#1-1 |/AC DELCO As Spec 41% No Bid No Bid
#1-2 In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-1: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
As S
#1-3 ANCO WIPER BLADES No Bid No Bid 5 bec 77.70%
Anco/Trico
Bosch, Trico . .
#1-4 In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-3: Wiper Blades 41% No Bid No Bid
#1-5 AUTOLITE As Spec 41% No Bid No Bid
#1-6 In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-5: No Bid No Bid Champion 10%
#1-7 BALDWIN FILTERS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
WIX, Microgard
#1-8 In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-7: Filtersg 41% No Bid No Bid
#1-9 BENDIX BRAKE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BrakeBest,
#1-10 In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-9: Raybestos, 41.00% No Bid No Bid
Wagner Brakes
#1-11 |BOSCH As Spec 41% No Bid No Bid




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Tabulation of Automotive/Light Truck Repair Parts - Bid #23-0124 Opened March 21, 2023 at 1:00 p.m. EST
Percentage Discount off Current List Price per Advance Stores Company,
Manufacturer or Approved Alternate. Incorporated dba Advance Auto AutoZone Parts, Inc. 1-800 Radiator + A/C of Sarasota
THIS BID IS FOR NEW PARTS ONLY. Parts
Percent P t Percent
# Items Manufacturer: . Manufacturer: .ercen Manufacturer: .

Discount: Discount: Discount:

#1-12 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-11: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Belts - 33.00%
#1-13 | DAYCO Dayco y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hoses - 14.00%

#1-14 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-13: Carquest 33% Continental 50% No Bid No Bid
#1-15 |FRAM FRAM 5% As Spec 50% No Bid No Bid
#1-16 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-15: Carquest 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Belts - 33.00%
#1-17 |GATES Gates y Continental 50% No Bid No Bid
Hoses - 14.00%

#1-18 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-17: Carquest 14% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-19 MONROE Monroe 15% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-20|In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-19: No Bid No Bid FCS 50.00% No Bid No Bid
#1-21 \MOOG MOOG 20% As Spec 50% No Bid No Bid




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Tabulation of Automotive/Light Truck Repair Parts - Bid #23-0124 Opened March 21, 2023 at 1:00 p.m. EST

Percentage Discount off Current List Price per Fleet Acquisitions LLC dba Fleet |IEH Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus
Manufacturer or Approved Alternate. d NEOPART TRANSIT LLC
THIS BID IS FOR NEW PARTS ONLY. Products Auto Parts
Percent Percent Percent
# | Items Manufacturer: .ercen Manufacturer: .ercen Manufacturer: .ercen
Discount: Discount: Discount:
Standard Motor
#1-12 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-11: 61% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Products
#1-13 |DAYCO No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid As Spec 10%
#1-14 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-13: Gates 67% GATES 60% No Bid No Bid
#1-15 |FRAM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
WIX, AUTO
EXTRA OIL &
#1-16 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-15: Wix Light Duty 81.50% AIR, AUTO 78.05% No Bid No Bid
EXTRA FUEL &
TRANS

#1-17 |GATES As Spec 67% AS SPEC 60% As Spec 10%
#1-18 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-17: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-19 |MONROE As Spec 59% AS SPEC 61% No Bid No Bid
#1-20 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-19: No Bid No Bid FCS 56% No Bid No Bid
#1-21 | MOOG As Spec 62% AS SPEC 67% No Bid No Bid




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Tabulation of Automotive/Light Truck Repair Parts - Bid #23-0124

Opened March 21, 2023 at 1:00 p.m. EST

Percentage Discount off Current List Price per O'Reilly Automotive Stores, Inc. . .
Manufacturer or Approved Alternate. dba O'Reill Vehicle Maintenance Program
THIS BID IS FOR NEW PARTS ONLY. a O'Reilly Auto Parts
P t P t
# ltems Manufacturer: .ercen Manufacturer: .ercen
Discount: Discount:
#1-12 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-11: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-13 |DAYCO No Bid No Bid As Spec 30%
MasterPro Belts
#1-14 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-13: 41% Goodyear 75%
& Hoses
#1-15 |FRAM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mobile 1, K&N .
#1-16 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-15: Filters 41% Luberfiner 59%
#1-17 |GATES As Spec 41% As Spec 45%
#1-18 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-17: No Bid No Bid Goodyear 75%
#1-19 IMONROE As Spec 41% No Bid No Bid
#1-20 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-19: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-21 |MOOG No Bid No Bid As Spec 12%




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Tabulation of Automotive/Light Truck Repair Parts - Bid #23-0124

Opened March 21, 2023 at 1:00 p.m. EST

Percentage Discount off Current List Price per Advance Stores Company,
Manufacturer or Approved Alternate. Incorporated dba Advance Auto AutoZone Parts, Inc. 1-800 Radiator + A/C of Sarasota
THIS BID IS FOR NEW PARTS ONLY. Parts
Percent Percent Percent
# | Items Manufacturer: . Manufacturer: . Manufacturer: .

Discount: Discount: Discount:
#1-22 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-21: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-23 |MOPAR No Bid No Bid As Spec 50% No Bid No Bid
#1-24 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-23: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-25 /MOTORCRAFT Motorcraft | Filters - 65.00% As Spec 50% No Bid No Bid
#1-26 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-25: Carquest 65% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-27 |PHILIPS LIGHTING Philips Lighting 8% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-28 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-27: Carquest 8% Sylvania 50% No Bid No Bid
#1-29 |PRECISION BEARING No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-30 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-29: No Bid No Bid National 50% No Bid No Bid
#1-31 |STANT (MOTORAD) Stant 14% As Spec 50% As Spec 45%
#1-32 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-31: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1-800 All Parts 45%




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Tabulation of Automotive/Light Truck Repair Parts - Bid #23-0124 Opened March 21, 2023 at 1:00 p.m. EST

Percentage Discount off Current List Price per Fleet Acquisitions LLC dba Fleet |IEH Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus
Manufacturer or Approved Alternate. NEOPART TRANSIT LLC
THIS BID IS FOR NEW PARTS ONLY. Products Auto Parts
Percent Percent Percent
# | Items Manufacturer: . Manufacturer: . Manufacturer: .

Discount: Discount: Discount:
#1-22 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-21: No Bid No Bid MEVOTECH 67% No Bid No Bid
#1-23 IMOPAR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-24 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-23: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

AS SPEC
#1-25 |[MOTORCRAFT As Spec 45% DEALER LESS 0% No Bid No Bid
0%

#1-26 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-25: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-27 |PHILIPS LIGHTING No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-28 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-27: Eiko 70% SYLVANIA 60% No Bid No Bid
#1-29 |PRECISION BEARING No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-30 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-29: Timken 67% BCA BEARINGS 66% No Bid No Bid
#1-31 |STANT (MOTORAD) No Bid No Bid AS SPEC 60% No Bid No Bid
#1-32 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-31: Gates 67% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Tabulation of Automotive/Light Truck Repair Parts - Bid #23-0124

Opened March 21, 2023 at 1:00 p.m. EST

Percentage Discount off Current List Price per O'Reilly Automotive Stores, Inc. _ .
Manufacturer or Approved Alternate. dba O'Reill Vehicle Maintenance Program
THIS BID IS FOR NEW PARTS ONLY. a O'Reilly Auto Parts
Percent Percent
# | ltems Manufacturer: ] Manufacturer: ]
Discount: Discount:

Precision,

MasterPro, . .
#1-22 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-21: ) 41% No Bid No Bid

Spicer, Dorman,
Import Direct
#1-23 IMOPAR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-24 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-23: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-25 |MOTORCRAFT As Spec 41% No Bid No Bid
#1-26 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-25: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-27 |PHILIPS LIGHTING No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sylvania, EiKO,

#1-28 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-27: Grote, 41% No Bid No Bid

Optronics
#1-29 |PRECISION BEARING As Spec 41% No Bid No Bid
#1-30 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-29: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-31 |STANT (MOTORAD) No Bid No Bid As Spec 60.65%
#1-32 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-31: Murray 41% No Bid No Bid
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Tabulation of Automotive/Light Truck Repair Parts - Bid #23-0124

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Opened March 21, 2023 at 1:00 p.m. EST

Percentage Discount off Current List Price per Advance Stores Company,
Manufacturer or Approved Alternate. Incorporated dba Advance Auto AutoZone Parts, Inc. 1-800 Radiator + A/C of Sarasota
THIS BID IS FOR NEW PARTS ONLY. Parts
Percent P t Percent
# | Items Manufacturer: . Manufacturer: 'ercen Manufacturer: .
Discount: Discount: Discount:
#1-33 | TIMKEN Timken 20% As Spec 50% No Bid No Bid
#1-34 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-33: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-35 WAGNER Wagner 35% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-36 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-35: Carquest 35% Bosch /GRI 50% No Bid No Bid
Wagner . . . .
#1-37 |WAGNER LIGHTING A 8% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lighting
#1-38 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-37: Carquest 8% Eiko 50% No Bid No Bid
Indicate additional names of manufacturers not Percent Percent Percent
indicated above and discount off current list price. | Manufacturer: Discount: Manufacturer: Discount: Manufacturer: Discount:
THIS RID IS FOR NFW PARTS ONLY : : :
D , UAC,
#2-1 Additional Manufacturer: enso 45%
Global
Cryomayx,
#2-2 Additional Manufacturer: 4 X 45%
RadCool, TYG
APC, AP
#2-3 Additional Manufacturer: 45%
Exhaust
R hu, Pacifi
#2-4 Additional Manufacturer: anshu, Facitic 45%
Best
Any other not
#2-5 Additional Manufacturer: 4 45%
named*
i *Only brands 1-800 Radiator
Notes:
has access to.
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THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA
Tabulation of Automotive/Light Truck Repair Parts - Bid #23-0124 Opened March 21, 2023 at 1:00 p.m. EST

Percentage Discount off Current List Price per Fleet Acquisitions LLC dba Fleet |IEH Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus

Manufacturer or Approved Alternate. Prod A P NEOPART TRANSIT LLC
THIS BID IS FOR NEW PARTS ONLY. roducts uto Parts
Percent Percent Percent
# | Items Manufacturer: . Manufacturer: . Manufacturer: .
Discount: Discount: Discount:
#1-33 | TIMKEN As Spec 67% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NATIONAL
#1-34 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-33: No Bid No Bid SEALS 66% No Bid No Bid
#1-35 |WAGNER No Bid No Bid AS SPEC 70% No Bid No Bid
#1-36 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-35: Raybestos 66% RAYBESTOS 60% No Bid No Bid
#1-37 |WAGNER LIGHTING As Spec 70% AS SPEC 65% No Bid No Bid
#1-38 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-37: No Bid No Bid SYLVANIA 60% No Bid No Bid
Indicate additional names of manufacturers not Percent Percent Percent
indicated above and discount off current list price. | Manufacturer: | .~ | Manufacturer: | . | Manufacturer: | .
THIS RID IS FOR NFW PARTS ONLY : ' '
Meritor/Rock
#2-1 Additional Manufacturer: Walker Exhaust 63% ert oél/l ockw 35%
#2-2 Additional Manufacturer: National Seals 67% Haldex 25%
-, Grote
#2-3 Additional Manufacturer: Hardware 60% MGM 15%
Global Part
#2-4 |Additional Manufacturer: Di(:tr?bu:;r: 75% Wabco/ZF 15%
#2-5 |Additional Manufacturer: Ideal Clamps 70% Truck Lite 15%

Notes:

13



THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Tabulation of Automotive/Light Truck Repair Parts - Bid #23-0124

Opened March 21, 2023 at 1:00 p.m. EST

Percentage Discount off Current List Price per
Manufacturer or Approved Alternate.
THIS BID IS FOR NEW PARTS ONLY.

O'Reilly Automotive Stores, Inc.
dba O'Reilly Auto Parts

Vehicle Maintenance Program

Percent Percent
# ltems Manufacturer: ) Manufacturer: )
Discount: Discount:
#1-33 |TIMKEN No Bid No Bid As Spec 69.04%
BCA/National,
#1-34 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-33: /Nati 41% SKF 69.90%
MasterPro
#1-35 |WAGNER As Spec 41% As Spec 82.80%
#1-36 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-35: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-37 |WAGNER LIGHTING No Bid No Bid As Spec 67.15%
#1-38 |In House Brand Manufacturer for #1-37: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Indicate additional names of manufacturers not Percent Percent
indicated above and discount off current list price. | Manufacturer: | .~ | Manufacturer: | .
THIS RID IS FOR NFW PARTS ONIL Y : :
S ttached
#2-1 Additional Manufacturer: e? attache 41%
line card
#2-2 Additional Manufacturer:
#2-3 Additional Manufacturer:
#2-4 Additional Manufacturer:
#2-5 Additional Manufacturer:

Notes:
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Tabulation of Automotive/Light Truck Repair Parts - Bid #23-0124

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Opened March 21, 2023 at 1:00 p.m. EST

Percentage Discount off Current List Price per Advance Stores Company,
Manufacturer or Approved Alternate. Incorporated dba Advance Auto AutoZone Parts, Inc. 1-800 Radiator + A/C of Sarasota
THIS BID IS FOR NEW PARTS ONLY. Parts
P t P t P t
# Items Manufacturer: .ercen Manufacturer: 'ercen Manufacturer: .ercen
Discount: Discount: Discount:
Contact: M. Todd Sanders Shant Aslan Jerome Dewberry
Address: 4200 Six Forks Road 123 S. Front Street 1470 Northgate Blvd
Raleigh, NC 27609 Memphis, TN 38103 Sarasota, FL 34234
Phone: 919-909-6348 310-901-1751 941-756-5630
Fax: 919-301-4079 941-756-5635
EIN# 54-0118110 66-0557319 83-0943791
Email: debra.carey@advance-auto.com| shant.aslan@autozone.com jerryd@1800radiator.com
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THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Tabulation of Automotive/Light Truck Repair Parts - Bid #23-0124 Opened March 21, 2023 at 1:00 p.m. EST

Percentage Discount off Current List Price per Fleet Acquisitions LLC dba Fleet |IEH Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus
Manufacturer or Approved Alternate. d NEOPART TRANSIT LLC
THIS BID IS FOR NEW PARTS ONLY. Products Auto Parts
P t P t P t
# | Items Manufacturer: .ercen Manufacturer: .ercen Manufacturer: .ercen
Discount: Discount: Discount:
Contact: John Stace Williams Brian Evanoka Kere Frey
Address: 6510 Golden Groves Lane 901 N. Lenola Rd 5C Dutch Court
Tampa, FL 33610 Moorestown, NJ 08057 Reading, PA 19608

Phone: 813-621-1734 855-214-9055 888-332-2606
Fax: 813-626-2010 800-723-1377 610-518-7551
EIN# 62-1868964 47-3322066 36-483-0017
Email: swilliams@fleetproducts.com fleetparts@autoplusap.com kfrey@neoparttransit.com
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THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA
Tabulation of Automotive/Light Truck Repair Parts - Bid #23-0124

Opened March 21, 2023 at 1:00 p.m. EST

Percentage Discount off Current List Price per
Manufacturer or Approved Alternate.
THIS BID IS FOR NEW PARTS ONLY.

O'Reilly Automotive Stores, Inc.
dba O'Reilly Auto Parts

Vehicle Maintenance Program

# |ltems Manufacturer: D’:::;i:tt: Manufacturer: D'::::J:tt:
Contact: Raonen Barron Lindi Brooks
Address: 233 S. Patterson Ave 3595 N. Dixie Hwy Bay 7

Springfield, MO 65802 Boca Raton, FL 33431
Phone: 417-829-5879 561-362-6080
Fax: 417-874-7250 561-362-7994
EIN# 44-0618012 52-1574660
Email: probids@oreillyauto.com lindi@vmpparts.com
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THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA
JUSTIFICATION FOR AWARD TO OTHER THAN APPARENT LOW BIDDER

Automotive/Light Truck Repair Parts - Bid #23-0124 Opened March 21, 2023 at 1:00 p.m. EST

Item #

Vendor

Justification

All

AutoZone Parts, Inc.

Non-responsive to the bid due to changing the Terms and Conditions for the bid.
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